Mr. DeLeo of Winthrop and others move to consolidate the following amendments: 14,
54,92, 107, 108, 109, 110, 111, 112, 113, 122, 132, 147, 148, 149, 151, 152, 153, 154,
155, 156, 157, 158, 159, 160, 162, 215, 218, 226, 227, 268, 299, 370, 527, 530, 531, 532,
533, 534, 535, 536, 537, 538, 539, 540, 541, 542, 547, 561, 562, 582, 588, 612, 621, 666,
669, 683, 686, 706, 713, 747, 752, 770, 781, 698, 857, 868, 910, 930, 961, 972, 1033,
1042, 1071, 1072, 1087, 1100, 1147, 1183, 1190, 1197, 1198, 1199, 1200, 1201, 1209,
1218, 1245, 1246, 1273, and 1301 and hereby move to amend H.4000 in section 2 in line
item 0321-2100 by striking out the figures "$500,000" and inserting in place thereof the
figure "$550,000."

And move further to amend the bill in section 2 in line item 0321-2000 by striking out
the figure "$538,905” and inserting in place thereof the figure "$585,905".

And move further to amend the bill in section 2 in line item 0330-0300 by adding at the
end thereof the following: "'; provided further, that not less than $100,000 shall be
expended from this line item for a contract with Massachusetts General Hospital for a
research program on abused children”; and in said item by striking out the figure
"$112,520,712" and inserting the figure "$112,620,712".

And move further to amend the bill in section 2 by striking out line item 0330-0410 and
inserting in place thereof the following:—

0330-0410 For alternative dispute resolution services for the trial court;
provided, that such services shall be made available to the
extent possible in connection with child care, protection and
custody proceedings in juvenile and probate courts; provided
further that not less than $44,337 shall be expended for North
Central Court Services, Inc.; provided further, that not less than
$40,000 shall be expended for the North Shore Community
Mediation Program in Salem; provided further, that not less than
$48,032 shall be expended for Metropolitan Mediation Services;
provided further, that not less than $36,947 shall be expended
for Community Mediation of Worcester; provided further, that not
less than $62,811 shall be expended for Mediation Works, Inc;
provided further, that not less than $50,000 shall be expended
for Quabbin Mediation in Athol; provided further, that not less
than $25,863 shall be expended for the Mediation and Training
Collaborative of Franklin County in Greenfield; provided further,
that not less than $50,000 shall be expended for Framingham
Court Mediation Services; provided further, that not less than
$42,737 shall be expended for Dispute Resolution Services, Inc.,
in Springfield district court; provided further, that not less than
$25,863 shall be expended for the Housing Services and
Mediation Program operated by the Berkshire County Regional
Housing Authority in Pittsfield; provided further, that not less than
$50,000 shall be expended for the Cape Cod Dispute Resolution
Center; provided further, that not less than $50,000 shall be
expended for the Community Dispute Settlement Center, Inc., of
Cambridge; provided further, that not less than $29,558 shall be
expended for Berkshire Mediation Services inc.; provided further,



that not less than $48,031 shall be expended for the Somerville
Mediation Program; provided further, that not less than $48,032
shall be expended for the Middlesex Multi-door Court House
Program; and provided further that not less than $30,000 shall
be expended for the Martha's Vineyard Mediation Program .............cccccevvveeeeeennn. $800,000

And move to further amend the bill in section 2 in line item 0330-3200, by striking out
the figure "$49,967,224" and inserting in place thereof the figure "$50,967,224".

And move to further amend the bill in section 2 in line item 0330-3333 by striking the
figure "$17,000,000" and inserting in place thereof the figure "$15,000,000"

And move to further amend the bill in section 2 in line item 0330-3334 by striking the
figure "$18,000,000"and inserting in place thereof the figure "$20,000,000"

And move to further amend the bill in section 2 in line item 0332-6300 by adding at the
end thereof the following:—

“That notwithstanding the provisions of any general or special law to the contrary, said
district court shall be the permanent location for the northern trial session to handle six
person jury cases; provided further, that all personnel within said district court whose
duties relate to said northern trial session shall report to the clerk magistrate of said
district court; and provided further, that the clerk magistrate shall utilize whatever space
within the facility at-large he deems necessary to comply with S.J.C. Rule 3:12, Canon
3(A)6.”

And move to further amend the bill in section 2, in item 0337-0300, by adding the
following:— "; provided that $145,841 shall be expended for the CASA program in
Springfield Juvenile Courts"

And move to further amend the bill in section 2, in item 0337-0400, by adding the
following:— *; provided further that $72,920 shall be expended for the CASA program
in the Worcester Juvenile Court”

And move to further amend the bill in section 2, in item 0337-0600, by adding the
following:— “;provided further that $91,150 shall be expended for the CASA program in
the Lawrence Juvenile Court”

And move to further amend the bill in section 2, in item 0337-0700, by adding the
following:— “;provided further that $77,478 shall be expended for the
Franklin/Hampshire CASA Program, including Northampton Greenfield, Orange and
Ware District Courts”

And move to further amend the bill in section 2, in item 0337-0800, by adding the
following:— “;provided further that $72,920 shall be expended for the CASA program in
the Plymouth County Juvenile Court”



And move to further amend the bill in section 2, in item 0337-0900, by adding the
following:— “;provided further that $54,690 shall be expended for a Berkshire CASA
program in the Berkshire County Juvenile Court”.

And move to further amend the bill in said section 2 in line item 0340-0100 by adding the
following:—

“; provided further, that not less than $150,000 shall be expended for the purpose of a targeted
controlled substance interdiction pilot program to be administered jointly by the district attorney
for Suffolk county and the chiefs of police for the city of Revere and the town of Winthrop. Said
office shall submit a report to the house and senate committees on ways and means no later than
June 1, 2006 which shall include, but not be limited to, the quantity and nature of drug seizers
resulting from implementation of said pilot program”.

And move to further amend the bill in said section 2, in item 0340-0100, by striking out
the figures “$13,630,699” and inserting in place thereof the figures “$13,917,006”.

And move to further amend the bill in said section 2, in item 0340-0200, by striking out
the figure "$10,656,975" and inserting in place thereof the figure "$10,763,545".

And move to further amend the bill in said section 2, in item 0340-0300, by striking out
the figures "$6,458,625" and inserting in place thereof the figures "$6,523,211".

And move to further amend the bill in said section 2, in line item 0340-0400, by striking
out the figures "$6,877,075" and inserting in place thereof the figures "$6,945,846".

And move to further amend the bill in said section 2, in line item 0340-0500, by striking
out the figures "$6,355,055" and inserting in place thereof the figures "$6,418,606".

And move to further amend the bill in said section 2, in line item 0340-0600, by striking
out the figures "$4,182,722" and inserting in place thereof the figures "$4,224,549",

And move to further amend the bill in said section 2, in line item 0340-0700, by striking
out the figures "$6,936,479" and inserting in place thereof the figures "$7,005,844".

And move to further amend the bill in said section 2, in line item 0340-0800, by striking
out the figures "$5,747,214" and inserting in place thereof the figures "$5,804,686".

And move to further amend the bill in said section 2, in line item 0340-0900, by striking
out the figures "$5,938,983" and inserting in place thereof the figures "$5,998,373".

And move to further amend the bill in said section 2 in line item 0340-1000 by inserting
at the end thereof the following:—

"provided further that not more than $20,000 be expended for Cape & Islands Child Advocacy
Center at Children's Cove in Hyannis".



And move to further amend the bill in said section 2, in line item 0340-1000, by striking
out the figures "$3,025,129" and inserting in place thereof the figures "$3,055,380".

And move to further amend the bill in said section 2, in line item 0340-1100, by striking
out the figures "$2,804,526" and inserting in place thereof the figures "$2,832,571".

And move to further amend the bill in said section 2, in line item 0340-2100, by striking
out the figures "$1,489,204" and inserting in place thereof the figures "$1,518,600".



