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FY24 Compliance Monitoring eGrants Step-by-Step 

Guide 

All subrecipients of MOVA-administered awards will undergo a formal compliance 
monitoring process with MOVA, also known as a site visit. While the site visit itself 
will be performed in-person, the pre-visit and post-visit processes will be 
conducted via MOVA’s electronic grants management system, eGrants.  MOVA 
may also initiate this process if a compliance issue is identified outside of a site 
visit process.   
 

Access to eGrants 
The Website 
Use this link to access the MOVA eGrants system.  Additional technical 
information about logging onto the eGrants system can be found in the eGrants 
Subrecipient Manual on eGrants by clicking the book icon in the top right corner 
of your Dashboard or from the eGrants webpage on MOVA’s website.  
 

 
 
Registered Users 
If a user has not yet been registered, visit the Registration Tutorial on MOVA's 
eGrants webpage or the eGrants Subrecipient Manual for instructions on 
registration. 

https://mova.intelligrants.com/
https://www.mass.gov/info-details/egrants
https://mova.intelligrants.com/Documentation/MOVA/Registration1.mp4
https://www.mass.gov/info-details/egrants
https://www.mass.gov/info-details/egrants
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Only the following users have the permissions to complete and submit and forms 
in the Compliance Monitoring Process: 

• Agency Administrator 

• Programmatic Contact 

• Alternate Programmatic Contact 

• Fiscal Contact 

• Authorized Representative 
 

Compliance Monitoring Process 
Scheduling the Site Visit 
A representative from MOVA will reach out to the organization via email to 
schedule the site visit. Once the site visit has been scheduled, the MOVA 
administrator will then initiate a Compliance Monitoring Report (CMR) process on 
eGrants. A notification email will be sent to the email addresses associated with 
the agency within eGrants to inform the users that a compliance monitoring 
report has been initiated. The first step in this process is for the user to complete 
the pre-visit worksheets and submit them to MOVA for review before the 
assigned deadline.   
 
Pre-Visit Worksheets 
To access the pre-visit worksheets, log in to eGrants. The Compliance Monitoring 
Report will be available on the Dashboard under My Tasks. See the example 
below: 
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The document type will say Compliance Monitoring Report and the Status will say 
Pre-Visit Work Sheets. Select the name of the document on the left-hand side 
(example circled in yellow above).  
 
If the Compliance Monitoring Report does not appear on the Dashboard under 
My Tasks, it can also be searched for by selecting the Searches menu from the top 
of the Dashboard window, opening the dropdown menu, and selecting 
Compliance Monitoring. See example below: 
 

 
 
Once the Compliance Monitoring search window appears, click the green Search 
button on the bottom right corner, or enter organization name into the 
Organization field and then click the Search button. All compliance monitoring 
processes that are available to the user will appear below the Document Search 
box in the Documents section. To select the document, click on the name of the 
document to open. See example below: 
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Once the document is open, the three pre-visit worksheets can be seen on the 
left-hand side menu. The Fiscal Monitoring Worksheet and Award Administration 
Monitoring Worksheet must be completed. The Programmatic Monitoring 
Worksheet should be reviewed but completion is not required. See example 
below: 

 
 
Click on each worksheet (highlighted in yellow above) and fill it out the Fiscal 
Monitoring Worksheet and the Award Administration Monitoring Worksheet 
completely. For SAFEPLAN programs, there are specific SAFEPLAN program 
questions at the end of the Programmatic Monitoring Worksheet that must be 
completed.  Save all work before exiting. The Save button can be found on the 
upper right-hand corner. Worksheets can be saved while they are being worked 
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on and the user can revisit worksheets an unlimited number of times prior to 
submission (see Submitting Completed Monitoring Worksheets below).   
 
All pre-visit worksheets will contain a due date, which is the date by which the 
worksheets must be completed and submitted to MOVA via eGrants. The due 
date can be seen in the first field of each monitoring worksheet. See example 
below: 
 

 
 
Correcting Errors 
If attempting to save when there are errors, an exclamation point will appear in 
the upper right-hand corner along with a box titled “Attention”, which will explain 
where the errors are that need to be modified prior to submission. See example 
below: 
 

 
Worksheets can be saved with error messages but cannot be submitted until all 
error messages are resolved. Once a worksheet is completed with no errors, a 
check mark will appear next to the document title on the left-hand side of the 
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window. As shown in the image above, if an exclamation point appears to the 
right of the worksheet name, the worksheet contains errors that must be resolved 
prior to submission. When all three worksheets are successfully completed and 
saved with three checkmarks then they are ready to be submitted to MOVA.  
 
Submitting Completed Monitoring Worksheets 
To submit the completed worksheets, scroll down to “Status Options” in the 
menu on the left-hand side of the window. Click “Pre-Visit Worksheets 
Submitted”. See example below: 
 

 
 
The worksheets have now been submitted to the MOVA administrator. The 
MOVA administrator will review the completed worksheets. If the worksheets are 
error-free, there will be no further communication on eGrants until after the site 
visit has taken place. If there are any errors or modifications needed, the MOVA 
administrator may send the worksheets back to the user for revisions by changing 
the status to “Pre-Visit Work Sheets Modifications Required.”  
 
Pre-Visit Work Sheets Modifications Required 
If there are any errors within the pre-visit worksheet or modifications needed, the 
MOVA administrator may send the worksheets back to the user for revisions. 
When that happens, an email notification will be sent to the email addresses 
associated with the eGrants system stating that the status has been changed from 
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“Pre-Visit Worksheets Submitted” to “Pre-Visit Worksheets Modifications 
Required.” After receiving this email notification, log back in to eGrants. The 
returned worksheets can be accessed again through the Compliance Monitoring 
Report, which will be available from the Dashboard under My Tasks. If the 
Compliance Monitoring Report is not included under My Tasks, it can be searched 
for by selecting Searches from the menu across the top of the window. See the 
previous section on Pre-Visit Worksheets for further instructions on how to utilize 
the search function to find a compliance monitoring report process.  
 
Once the Compliance Monitoring Report has been found, open the document by 
clicking on the name (CMR-2024-XXXX-XX). From the Document Landing Page, 
scroll down the menu on the left-hand side of the window to the Notes section. 
An exclamation point indicates that there is a note from the MOVA administrator. 
At this stage in the compliance monitoring process the note will explain what 
modifications are needed to the pre-visit worksheets. See example below: 
 

 
 
Click on “Notes” (highlighted in yellow in the image above) to see the message 
from the MOVA administrator which will provide an explanation of why the pre-
visit worksheets were sent back and what modifications are required.  
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The note can be responded to by clicking “New Note” on the upper right-hand 
corner (circled in red in the example below) or by typing in the text box below the 
received note (field highlighted in yellow in the example below). In order to 
ensure that the note is saved and sent, click the paper airplane icon in the bottom 
right-hand corner of the message window. See example below: 
 

 
 
Once the note has been reviewed, make the required changes to the pre-visit 
worksheets. After making changes to any of the pre-visit worksheets, remember 
to select the Save button in the upper right-hand corner of the screen. The Save 
button should be utilized after revisions are made to each individual pre-visit 
worksheet.  
 
Pre-Visit Work Sheets Modifications Submitted 
After making the required modifications, the worksheets will be ready to be 
resubmitted. Scroll down to Status Options in the menu on the left-hand side of 
the window and click “Pre-Visit Work Sheets Modifications Submitted”. This will 
send the modified worksheets back to the MOVA administrator for further 
review. If further revisions are required, then the process will be repeated.  This 
process can occur as many times as MOVA requires until the Pre-Visit Worksheets 
are completed successfully. Once the Pre-Visit Worksheets are completed 
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successfully, the MOVA administrator will change the status to “Monitoring in 
Process.” 
 
 
Monitoring in Process 
When the status is changed to “Monitoring in Process” that means that the pre-
visit worksheets have been completed and will be reviewed by MOVA. No action 
is required from users at this time. The next step in the compliance 
monitoring/site visit process that will take place in eGrants will occur after the in-
person or virtual site visit meeting takes place.  
 
Monitoring Follow-up in Process 
Following the in-person or virtual site visit meeting, users will receive an email 
notification indicating that the Compliance Monitoring Process has been changed 
to the status of “Monitoring Follow-up in Process”.  This means that there are 
follow-up items from the site visit that need to be addressed to complete the 
compliance monitoring process. If there are no follow-up actions required from 
the site visit, this step will be skipped and the next step in the process will be 
Monitoring Finding Acknowledgement Required. See the Monitoring Finding 
Acknowledgement Required section below.  
 
To address follow-up items, the user will log in to eGrants to view a note from the 
MOVA administrator detailing what needs to be addressed during the follow-up 
process. To access the note, the user will first navigate to the Compliance 
Monitoring Report process for their agency. The Compliance Monitoring Report 
will appear in My Tasks on the Dashboard with a status of “Monitoring Follow up 
in Process.” If the Compliance Monitoring Report is not included under My Tasks, 
it can be searched for by selecting Searches from the menu across the top of the 
window. See the previous section on Pre-Visit Worksheets for further instructions 
on how to utilize the search function to find a compliance monitoring report 
process.  
 
Once the Compliance Monitoring Report has been found, open the document by 
clicking on the name (CMR-2024-XXXX-XX). From the Document Landing Page, 
scroll down the menu on the left-hand side of the window to the Notes section. 
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An exclamation point indicates that there is a note from the MOVA administrator 
explaining what follow-up is needed. The note from the MOVA Administrator will 
describe what follow-up is needed and the actions that the user should take to 
address the follow-up items.  
 
To address the follow-up items, please complete the requests outlined in the note 
from the MOVA administrator and then reply to the note.  The note can be 
responded to by clicking “New Note” on the upper right-hand corner or by typing 
in the text box below the received note. See the example in the previous section 
on Pre-Visit Work Sheets Modifications Required for more information on the 
Notes feature. Attachments can be uploaded and attached to the note by 
selecting the paperclip icon on the bottom right-hand corner of the note field. 
Once the note is composed and any documents attached, click on the paper 
airplane icon in the bottom right-hand corner of the message window to save and 
send the note to the MOVA administrator.  See example below: 

 
After addressing the follow-up items included in the note from the MOVA 
administrator, and sending a note in response, navigate to “Status Options” on 
the left side of the page and change the status to “Monitoring Follow up 
Submitted.  See example below: 
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The MOVA administrator will then review the submitted follow-up. This process 
can be repeated as many times as needed until the follow up period is completed.  
 
Monitoring Finding Acknowledgement Required 
Once the monitoring follow-up period has ended, a notification email will be sent 
to the email addresses associated with the eGrants platform to inform the user 
that the compliance monitoring process status has been changed to “Monitoring 
Finding Acknowledgement Required.” This means that MOVA has completed the 
Site Visit Report and Acknowledgement Form and both forms are available for the 
user to view and acknowledge on eGrants. To access the Site Visit Report and the 
Acknowledgment form, first log into eGrants. The Compliance Monitoring Report 
will be available on the Dashboard under My Tasks or can be searched for using 
the Search function found in the menu across the top of the window. See the 
previous section on Pre-Visit Worksheets for further instructions on how to utilize 
the search function to find a compliance monitoring report process. The status of 
the report will be “Monitoring Findings Acknowledgement Required.”  
 
 Open the document by clicking on the name (CMR-2024-XXXX-XX). This will take 
you to the Document Landing Page. From the Document Landing Page, scroll 
down the menu on the left-hand side to see the Site Visit Report and the 
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Acknowledgement Form. The Site Visit Report will be listed on the left side of the 
page with a check mark. The check mark appears next to the Site Visit Report 
because the Site Visit Report has been completed and is available for review by 
the user, there are no actions that need to be taken by the user to complete the 
form. The Acknowledgement Form will be listed with an exclamation point to 
indicate that it needs to be completed by the user.  See example below: 
 

 
 
Site Visit Report 
Click on the Site Visit Report to review the report and determine whether any 
findings were identified within the site visit process and, if so, if there are any 
findings that require corrective action to resolve. All identified findings will be 
listed within the Site Visit Report. There will be a description of the finding in the 
Finding Description field.  If no findings were identified during the site visit 
process, that will be indicated in the findings section of the report. Findings will 
be separated into two sections: Programmatic Findings and Fiscal Findings. 
 
If corrective action is required for any finding included in the site visit report that 
means that there are additional actions that must be taken by the user to resolve 
the identified finding. Any findings with associated corrective actions will have a 
Corrective Action Request field, which will outline the actions needed from the 
user to resolve the finding, and a Due Date field, which is the deadline for 
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completion and submission of the needed corrective action response. See 
example below from a sample Site Visit Report: 
 

 
 
Acknowledgement Form  
The Acknowledgement Form is a form the user must complete to acknowledge 
the findings identified during the site visit and, if required, submit responses to 
any corrective actions. Select the Acknowledgement Form from the left-hand 
menu to open it. The user should complete all fields within the Acknowledgement 
Form that require acknowledgement and response. In the upper right-hand 
corner of the form an Attention box will provide instruction as to what is required 
on the form. See example below of a Programmatic Finding: 
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If there are findings noted in the Site Visit Report, they will be listed and 
described on the Acknowledgment form. Use the Corrective Action Response field 
to describe the actions taken to resolve the finding and the Corrective Action 
Upload field to submit any requested materials. See example below: 
 

 
 
If there are no findings, or if the findings do not require corrective action, the 
Acknowledgment Form must still be completed by clicking on the 
Acknowledgment radio button, saving, and submitting the form. If there are 
findings requiring corrective action, when the corrective action response(s) and 
corrective action upload(s) have been completed, click on the Acknowledgment 
radio button. Once the form has been completed, select the Save button in the 
upper right-hand corner of the window. If there are any incomplete fields, an 
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error notification will be generated and in the upper right-hand corner of the 
form and an attention box will appear and provide instruction as to what is 
required on the form. Once the form is saved successfully without error, navigate 
to the Status Options on the left-hand side menu and change the status to 
“Monitoring Findings Acknowledgment Submitted” then choose OK to submit. 
The Acknowledgement Form will then go to the MOVA administrator for review.  
 
If further information is required by MOVA after the Acknowledgment Form has 
been submitted, users will receive a notification via email and the Compliance 
Monitoring process will return to Monitoring Findings Acknowledgment Required. 
This will require the user to log back in to eGrants. The Compliance Monitoring 
Report process will be available from the Dashboard under My Tasks. If it cannot 
be found under My Tasks, the process can be searched for by selecting Searches 
from the menu across the top of the window. See the previous section on Pre-
Visit Worksheets for further instructions on how to utilize the search function to 
find a compliance monitoring report process. Once the Compliance Monitoring 
Report has been found, open the document by clicking on the name (CMR-2024-
XXXX-XX). From the Document Landing Page, scroll down the menu on the left-
hand side of the window to the Notes section. An exclamation point indicates that 
there is a note from the MOVA administrator explaining what further steps are 
needed from the user to acknowledge and resolve any findings. After these steps 
have been completed, the user must re-save the Acknowledgement form and 
then navigate to the Status Options on the left-hand side menu and change the 
status to “Monitoring Findings Acknowledgement Submitted” again. This process 
will be repeated until all findings have been acknowledged and corrective actions 
resolved successfully.  
 
Monitoring Complete 
When all findings have been acknowledged and resolved successfully, the status 
of the Compliance Monitoring Report process will change to Monitoring 
Complete. At this point, users will receive an email indicating that the status of 
the Compliance Monitoring Report process has been changed to “Monitoring 
Complete.” Once the status has been changed by the MOVA Administrator to 
Monitoring Complete, the site visit process has ended and there are no further 
actions required from the user.  


