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ricular activity. The program can be
presented weekly or monthly. It can be
tailored to fill the requirements of vari-
ous courses. In Southbridge, for exam-
ple, LGP comes under the School-to-
Career Program. In Southwick/Tolland
Regional High School, it is under the
umbrella of history/civics. The Oakmont
Regional High School has incorporated
the program into the government class
as part of its regular curriculum. The
Town Council in Franklin is instituting

a “Government Day” in the schools.
Exposing students to the functions of
various town offices and offering op-
portunities to participate in their own
communities is the common thread.

Students can use the program to ex-
plore areas of interest. For example,
potential business or finance majors
can volunteer with their towns’ finance
committees. Those interested in envi-
ronmental issues can assist the con-
servation commission or the planning
board. Capitalizing on a student’s inter-
ests allows him/her to gain valuable
experience and discover new possibil-
ities. In addition, the student has the
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How can we encourage citizens to be-
come informed and to participate in
their communities’ governments? The
Local Government Partnership Program
(LGP) is an innovative partnership be-
tween local schools, municipal officials
and the Department of Revenue’s Divi-
sion of Local Services. Designed to
promote an understanding of local gov-
ernment, LGP invites municipal officials
to discuss the functions and responsi-
bilities of their towns’ governments with
high school students. Through educa-
tion, LGP hopes to generate enthusi-
asm and participation in local govern-
ment, both now and in the future.

Originally developed in 1995, the pro-
gram has been recently redesigned to
blend with new requirements imposed
by Education Reform. Districts that have
reinstituted the program are Oakmont
Regional (Ashburnham), Ludlow, Stur-
bridge and Winchendon. New Districts
include Billerica, Dracut, Lee, South-
bridge and Southwick.

At its inception, LGP consisted of two
components: a yearlong academic
classroom curriculum and a voluntary
program. State and local officials
taught the classes during the regular
school day. LGP has been reconfig-
ured because of new state curriculum
frameworks. Instead of being offered
only as part of the regular curriculum,
the program can now be incorporated
into existing programs, introduced as
an elective, or offered as an extracur-
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opportunity to make a real contribution
to his/her community.

Some students involved in past pro-
grams have become so interested in
government, they have successfully
run for office. In Ludlow, a high school
senior was elected to the town council.
In Palmer, voters elected a student to
the planning board. In almost all partic-
ipating communities, students have at-
tended town meetings.

Local government is closest to its citi-
zens, and LGP offers students an op-
portunity to understand first hand how
democracy functions. For more infor-
mation contact: Diane M. Murphy, Re-
gional Manager, Division of Local Serv-
ices, at (413) 784-1000 ext. 20603. ■

LGP offers students
an opportunity to
understand how
democracy functions.
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Subdivision Plan
Approval
From time to time, local communities
have asked the Department for advice
on what “majority” means in the context
of voting requirements for approval of
vendor warrants or abatements. The
same issue was addressed (for subdivi-
sion plan approval) by the Supreme Ju-
dicial Court (SJC). In McElderry v. Plan-
ning Board of Nantucket, the SJC was
asked to decide whether a planning
board’s approval of a definitive subdivi-
sion plan required an affirmative vote of
a majority of a quorum, or a majority of
the entire board.1 The court held that an
approval requires affirmative votes by a
majority of the members of the board.

In November 1997, the McElderrys
submitted a definitive subdivision plan
to the Nantucket Planning Board. Ap-
proval of the plan required waivers of
some of the board’s rules including the
size of the roadway. The planning
board held several hearings. Three of
the five board members, a legal quo-
rum, attended and voted at the Febru-
ary 9, 1998 hearing. By a two-to-one
vote, the members granted a roadway
waiver and, by the same margin, also
approved the plan with certain modifi-
cations recommended by the board’s
engineering consultant. The chairman
of the board who had dissented filed a
certification of the board’s disapproval
with the town clerk, since it was his be-
lief that approval of any subdivision
plan required a majority of the entire
board. The McElderrys immediately
brought suit in superior court claiming
that the subdivision plan had been
properly approved. If that were not true,
they also contended that the board

acted improperly in disapproving the
plan. The superior court judge held
that the effect of the planning board
vote was to disapprove the plan. This
decision was directly appealed to the
Supreme Judicial Court.

The plaintiffs argued that the Subdivi-
sion Control Law is silent on voting re-
quirements.2 There are also no appel-
late decisions on this issue. As a result,
the plaintiffs claimed that the general
rule set forth in Clark v. City Council of
Waltham should control.3 In Clark, the
SJC had confirmed a mayoral appoint-
ment where the candidate received only
four of eleven possible votes. Ten mem-
bers were present at the Waltham city
council meeting. Four members voted
in favor of the appointment, one op-
posed, and five members abstained.
Under Clark, the general rule is that, ab-
sent some statutory restriction, the ma-
jority of a council or board is a quorum
and a majority of the quorum can act.

According to the SJC, however, there
was a statutory restriction in the Subdi-
vision Control Law. In the court’s view,
M.G.L. Ch. 41, Sec. 81A and following,
sets forth a detailed procedure for an
owner to receive approval to subdivide
his land into lots in order to record an
approved plan at the Registry of
Deeds. Under the express terms of
M.G.L. Ch. 41, Sec. 81L, an endorse-
ment of approval requires the signa-
tures of a “majority of the members of a
planning board” or such representative
of the board so authorized by a major-
ity of the board. Although different pro-
visions of the Subdivision Control Law
concerned “endorsement” and plan
“approval,” the court did not character-
ize this issue as materially significant.
In the court’s view, the statutory

scheme should not be interpreted to
lead to the illogical conclusion that less
than a majority of the entire board
could approve a plan, while endorse-
ment of the plan would require the sig-
natures of a majority of the members.

The court also looked to the Zoning
Act to bolster its interpretation of the
statute.4 The court viewed the Zoning
Act and the Subdivision Control Law
as two legislative measures to regulate
land development and use. Both
statutes require judicial proceedings to
determine the rights of the parties. In
the court’s view, both statutes should
have similar voting requirements. Al-
though it agreed that the Zoning Act
was more explicit on this topic, the
court believed there should be some
measure of consistency in reading both
statutes. The SJC wrote that it would be
unfair to apply a strict voting require-
ment when an applicant was seeking a
variance or special permit under the
Zoning Act, and then employ a more
relaxed standard when subdivision ap-
proval was sought. The court held that
a harmonious reading of both statutes
requires planning board approval to be
made by a majority of the members.
The SJC held that the Nantucket Plan-
ning Board by its two-to-one vote had
effectively disapproved the plan.

Consequently, a planning board can
conduct business if there is a quorum
present. Yet, the planning board cannot
approve a plan unless a majority of the
full board votes in favor of the plan. ■

written by James Crowley

1. 431 Mass. 722 (2000).

2. M.G.L. Ch. 41, Sec. 81L.

3. 328 Mass. 40 (1951).

4. M.G.L. Ch. 40A.

LEGAL in Our Opinion
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Motor Vehicle Excise
Receipts Stable
The total motor vehicle excise (MVE)
collected statewide increased less than
one percent from FY1998 to FY1999.
The change from FY1997 to FY1998
was 13.57 percent. Motor vehicle re-
ceipts as a percent of the total munici-
pal budget statewide decreased from
3.7 percent to 3.5 percent. Since MVE
collections are the second largest lo-
cally generated source of revenue after
the property tax for most cities and
towns, the slowdown in collections may
be a cause for concern. It is difficult to
know whether the stagnation is merely
a reaction to the large increase in the
previous year, when many people ap-
parently purchased new cars, related
to the timing of bills, or the beginning
of a trend. The average age of vehicles
has increased from 7.7 years in FY1998
to 8.45 years. Although people are evi-

FOCUS on Municipal Finance

dently keeping cars longer, the state-
wide average bill increased from $85.43
to $86.98 in FY1999.

The MVE is usually paid to the commu-
nity where the vehicle is garaged. The
Registry of Motor Vehicles (RMV) cal-
culates the amount of the motor vehi-
cle excise due by multiplying the ex-
cise value of the vehicle by the $25 per
thousand rate specified in the Mass-
achusetts General Laws. The excise
value of a vehicle is the applicable per-
centage of the manufacturer’s sug-
gested retail price for the year the vehi-
cle was manufactured. The applicable
percentages are:

In the year preceding the year
of manufacture . . . . . . . . . . . . . 50%

In the year of manufacture. . . . . . 90%
In the second year. . . . . . . . . . . . 60%
In the third year . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 40%
In the fourth year . . . . . . . . . . . . . 25%
In the fifth and succeeding years 10%

Figure 1 shows the total MVE collec-
tions from FY1990 through FY1999 in
actual dollars. Reflecting the economic
recession in the early 1990s, the total
MVE collections in FY1990 decreased
by over 15 percent from FY1989. Col-
lections then remained relatively stable
through FY1992. In 1992 the RMV
began to implement a non-renewal pro-
gram, placing licenses and registrations
in non-renewal status for non-payment
of the MVE. Such licenses or registra-
tions cannot be renewed until the MVE
and all fees and charges have been
paid in full. The non-renewal program
significantly increased collections in
FY1993; however, collections de-
creased to a more normal level in
FY1994. In FY1995 the Registry mailed
billing information in May rather than
July, increasing FY1995 totals and de-
creasing FY1996 totals. Collections
have increased steadily since then. The
FY1999 total collected was an all time
high of $473 million.

Local Trends
Table 1 shows MVE collections for
each of the 351 communities in Mass-
achusetts for FY1998 and FY1999. It
gives collections in FY1998 and
FY1999, the average age of vehicles,
the average MVE bill and the rank of
the average bill. Generally, as average
age increases the average bill de-
creases; however, in some communi-
ties, more expensive initial prices in-
crease the average bills even though
the vehicles are older. The RMV pro-
vides billing information, including ve-
hicle identification numbers and the
amounts of excise due, to the commu-
nity in which those vehicles are regis-
tered. This information is called a com-
mitment and there are usually several
commitments to each community within
one year. The community is responsi-
ble for sending out the bills and collect-

continued on page six ➡

Figure 1
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6 Division of Local Services CITY & TOWN January 2001

Motor Vehicle Excise Receipts Stable
➡ continued from page three

ing the amounts due. Average bills for
FY1999 have been calculated by divid-
ing the total MVE that the Registry com-
mitted to each community by the num-
ber of bills in that community.

When communities are arrayed start-
ing with the highest average MVE bill,
Weston is first at $168.72 and the town
of Wendell is last with $45.70. The five
communities with the highest average
bills are Weston ($168.72), Dover
($155.78), Wellesley ($145.58), Sud-
bury ($137.04) and Southborough
($136.05). Only two of those communi-
ties, Weston and Wellesley are among
the ten communities with the newest
vehicles. Wellesley ranks eighth with an
average age of 7.1 years and Weston
ranks tenth with an average age of 7.16.
Weston also ranked first for average bill
in FY1998, but the other four communi-
ties ranked differently.

The communities with the lowest aver-
age bills are Wendell ($45.70), Monroe
($49.34), Peru ($50.40), Chesterfield
($51.29) and Warwick ($51.37). All are
small towns in western Massachusetts
with less than 1,200 population. Al-
though all are in the bottom third when
ranked by average age of vehicles,
only Wendell is one of the ten commu-
nities with the oldest cars. Wendell also
had the lowest bill in FY1997, but ex-
cept for Peru the other communities
are different.

The communities with the oldest vehi-
cles tend to be located on the island of
Martha’s Vineyard. Aquinnah (12.34
years), Chilmark (12.32 years), West
Tisbury (11.74 years) and Oak Bluffs
(11. 73 years), are all island communi-
ties where summer residents often
leave an old car to avoid the hassle of
bringing a vehicle on the ferry, yet have
transportation available while on the is-
land. The five communities with the old-
est vehicles are the same as in FY1999,
but the average age in every town is
older. Three other island communities
appear in the top ten list: Nantucket

(11.28 years), Edgartown (11.07 years)
and Tisbury (11.01 years). Mount
Washington ranks third on average age
of vehicles at 11.8 years. Located on a
mountain in Berkshire County, with one
of the smallest populations in the state,
many of its vehicles are trucks. The
communities with the newest vehicles
are “commuter communities” located
along Routes 128 and 495. Lincoln
(4.42 years), Sharon (6.82 years),
Needham (6.88 years), Westborough
(6.93 years), and Canton (7.04 years)
are the five towns with the newest cars.

The information on MVE collections
used in this article comes from actual
receipts reported on the FY2000 tax
rate recapitulation sheets. The Registry
of Motor Vehicles provided information
on the average age of vehicles and the
total number of bills and excise com-
mitted in each community used to cal-
culate the average bills. ■

written by Jean McCarthy
data provided by Dora Brown

Farmland Valuation
In November 2000, the Bureau of Local
Assessment issued a Request for Re-
sponses for Professional Services
(RFR) to assist the Farmland Valuation
Advisory Commission (FVAC) in esti-
mating a range of “use values” for cer-
tain agricultural and horticultural land
(M.G.L. Ch. 61A). The goal of the RFR
is to have the contractor recommend
whether the existing valuation methods
and crop classifications should be re-
tained, revised or replaced. If alterna-
tive methodologies are recommended,
they must be able to be verified, up-
dated yearly (using readily available
and timely data) and respond to the
significant economic fluctuations in the
farming industry.

Per instruction, bidders submitted two
separate cost proposals. The first pro-
posal is for the study of the valuation
and classification of all horticultural and

agricultural land, including cranberry
land, in Massachusetts. The second is
only for the valuation and classification
of cranberry bog land and its neces-
sary and related land. In the event that
there is insufficient funding for the entire
project, DOR will give priority to award-
ing a contract for the review and rec-
ommendations related to cranberry
agricultural land, exclusively.

The chosen contractor will review the
current methods for the valuation of all
agricultural and horticultural land. This
review will include at a minimum:

• Analyzing long and short term eco-
nomic trends that have affected the
agricultural and horticultural industry; 

• Reviewing the functional classifica-
tions of land used for agricultural and
horticultural activities in Massachusetts,
(cranberry bogs, land used for tobacco,
nursery stock and vegetable produc-
tion, orchards, vineyards, forage crop-
land, pasture land, woodland, Christ-
mas tree stands and plantations, related
lands and non-productive lands);

• Reviewing the market, cost and in-
come approaches to valuing real prop-
erty, as they apply to agricultural and
horticultural land, and the land clas-
sifications recommended for use in
Massachusetts;

• Reviewing systems used by states
and/or large assessing jurisdictions
with similar agricultural and horticultural
land crops; and

• Providing data sources to be used to
update agricultural and horticultural
values annually by April 1.

DOR expects to award the contract in
early January 2001, and all work is to
be completed by March 1, 2001. There
is a provision contained in the contract
for a presentation to be made to inter-
ested parties, which would likely in-
clude assessors and farmers, when the
FVAC accepts the recommendations of
the contractor. The Bureau of Local As-
sessment will keep you informed. ■
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DLS UPDATE
Sewer Rate Relief Fund
The FY2001 appropriation for Sewer
Rate Relief is $53,914,000, unchanged
from the FY2000 appropriation. To re-
ceive Sewer Rate Relief Funds an en-
tity must have eligible indebtedness.
Eligible indebtedness is defined as
permanent debt issued on or after Jan-
uary 1, 1990, for a term greater than
five years to finance or refinance the
costs of planning, design, or construc-
tion of any water pollution control pro-
ject. The project must comply with the
Federal Water Pollution Control Act.
Projects which received state grants
are ineligible, and projects financed
through the Massachusetts Water Pol-
lution Abatement Trust (MWPAT) are
also ineligible unless an applicant’s
total issues through MWPAT exceeded
$50,000,000 on June 30, 1995.

Generally speaking, awards from the
Sewer Rate Relief Fund are computed
at 20 percent of the applicant’s eligible
debt service. DLS develops guidelines
to certify indebtedness and to ensure
the equitable distribution of funds in
consultation with the Department of En-
vironmental Protection. Application
forms were due by October 13, 2000.
The local board or official responsible
for setting sewer rates must submit cer-
tification that the funds have been or
will be used to reduce sewer charges
to DLS before funds can be distributed.
DLS has debt schedules on file for
cities, towns and districts that received
Sewer Rate Relief Funds last year. For
those communities, DLS will compute
the FY2001 award based on the infor-
mation on file in its office. However, if
there are additional new projects or
changes with respect to an approved
project, such as a bond refunding, then
additional documentation will be re-
quired to process the FY2001 award.

The Sewer Rate Relief Fund was estab-
lished in 1993 to help mitigate the esca-
lating costs of sewer service in Mass-
achusetts. DLS will issue award letters
in January and make payments by
March 31, 2001. Administration of this
program is assigned to James R. John-
son, Director of Accounts. Questions
should be directed to Christopher Har-
rington at (617) 626-2397.

Selected Forms and
Brochures Available
on Website
The Division of Local Services has
placed three municipal forms and six
brochures on its website. The forms
are: Personal Property Form of List
(State Tax Form 2); Return of Property
Held for Charitable Purposes (State Tax
Form 3ABC); and Application for Abate-
ment of Real or Personal Property Tax
(State Tax Form 128). The brochures
provide important information concern-
ing property taxation. One brochure
explains the property tax deferral pro-
gram available to qualifying persons
65 years of age or older. Another ex-
plains tax exemptions available to
charitable and religious organizations.
The remaining brochures explain prop-
erty tax exemptions available to blind
persons, qualifying veterans, surviving
spouses, minors and elderly persons.
To review and/or download these ma-
terials, go to www.state.ma.us/dls and
click on publications.

New Web Site Design
The Division of Local Services (DLS)
has adopted a new “look and feel” for
its website (www.state.ma.us/dls). The
updated format conforms to new de-
partmental standards aimed at clarity,
consistency, and improved perform-
ance. The model for the Local Services

site has been www.baystatebiz.com
that was described in the October/No-
vember issue of City & Town.

The new format is also a foundation for
new e-government services now under
development at the Department of Rev-
enue. New community status tracking,
data submission, and distance learning
applications will be implemented over
the next two years as part of an overall
conversion of Local Services’ Municipal
Databank from an older mainframe en-
vironment to an expanded Internet and
Oracle-based system.

New Rule on
Applications for
Abatement
There should be fewer disgruntled tax-
payers in the future. The postmark date
on each envelope will now be consid-
ered the date any enclosed property tax
abatement application was filed. Previ-
ously, abatement applications not phys-
ically in the assessor’s office on the due
date were denied because of filing late.
This caused taxpayer confusion, since
it is inconsistent with the rules on the
filing of income taxes on both the state
and federal levels. It is important to
note, however, that this change applies
to abatement applications only, not to
property tax payments.

Chapter 324 of the Acts of 2000 pro-
vides that an abatement application de-
livered to the assessors by the post of-
fice after the abatement due date is
deemed to have been received by
them as of the postmark date on the en-
velope. The new “postmark” rule also
applies to appeals of the assessors’
abatement application decisions. It ap-
plies only to applications mailed to the
assessors’ proper address, first class
postage prepaid, with postmarks made
by the United States Postal Service. ■
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Municipal Fiscal Calendar
February 1
Taxpayer: Deadline for payment of third quarterly tax bill without interest
(if mailed before January 1).

Taxpayer: Quarterly tax bills — application deadline for property tax
abatement.

February 15
Treasurer: Second quarterly reconciliation of cash (due 45 days after end of
quarter).

February 28
Finance Committee: Continue budget review and develop recommendations
(date variable depending on dates of town meetings).

Lisa Juszkiewicz Appointed Data Bank/
Local Aid Director
Lisa Juszkiewicz has been appointed Director of the Municipal Data Bank and
Local Aid Section. Prior to her appointment, Lisa worked as an analyst in the Local
Aid Section at the Division of Local Services for over 16 years. In this capacity,
Lisa has been recognized by both state and local officials for her consistently ex-
cellent work with cherry sheets, local aid distributions and various other local aid
related data requests. Within the Division, Lisa is known for the breadth of her
computer skills, ranging from her expertise with the Division’s mainframe database
to various other PC and Web-based applications. Her commitment to data quality
and customer service, as well as her technical skills, ensures that Data Bank re-
questors and website users will be well served in the future. ■

Databank Highlight
The Municipal Databank has several
reports including motor vehicle infor-
mation. The Registry of Motor Vehicles
provides the Databank with a listing of
the number of registered vehicles in
each community. The list identifies the
type (car, light truck, etc.) and average
age of the vehicles. The Databank also
has reports that show trends in Motor
Vehicle Excise Receipts back to FY81.
The Actual vs. Estimated Receipts re-
port, which is available on the website,
shows trends in actual collections
compared to budget estimates for
Motor Vehicle Excise as well as other
local receipts categories.

To obtain Municipal Databank information or techni-
cal questions concerning the website, contact Lisa
Juszkiewicz, Dora Brown or Debbie Ferlito at (617)
626-2300. ■


