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Team Behavioral Health, LLC ("TBH") is a behavioral health company. It is committed to bringing
psychiatric care to underserved communities by developing an array of specialized programs in
response to community need and in partnership with existing medical providers to expand services
and improve access to care. Specifically, TBH develops and operates psychiatric hospitals. The
leadership group has worked with Dr. Kresch, its manager, in the psychiatric hospital arena for
over twenty years.
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MATERIAL CHANGE NARRATIVE

DEVELOPMENT OF THE MATERIAL CHANGE

TBH and UMass Memorial Health Ventures, Inc. ("UMMHV"), a non-profit corporation and a wholly
controlled subsidiary of UMass Memorial Health Care, Inc. ("UMMHC"), propose to create a
joint-venture limited liability company, Worcester Behavioral Innovations, LLC (the "LLC"), that will
own and operate a new psychiatric hospital in central Massachusetts. Through these entities, the
ownership of the LLC will be 67% TBH and 33% UMMHV. Capital contributions, allocations, and
distributions will be in accordance with ownership percentages. No health care services will be
diminished or discontinued in the creation of the LLC or the new psychiatric hospital. Rather, the
establishment of the hospital will increase psychiatric medical service offerings in central
Massachusetts and the Commonwealth.

TBH does not anticipate that the Material Change will have any negative impact on reimbursement
rates, case referral patterns, access to needed services, and/or quality of care. Rather, the Material
Change and proposed Hospital, if approved, will positively impact large vulnerable populations in
Massachusetts needing skilled psychiatric services by increasing access to care in a safe
environment that specializes in those patients' needs. In addition, the opening of a new psychiatric
hospital in central Massachusetts will provide much needed relief to the emergency departments of
local area hospitals which take in mentally-ill patients, which will benefit the patient community at
large.

At present, TBH does not anticipate further Material Changes in the next 12 months, but will provide
any and all required Notices and regulatory applications to appropriate government agencies should
that change.

The parties will provide any notices and make any filings with government agencies as may be
required in support of this Material Change, including the Department of Mental Health.
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